
Benefits

For faculty, staff, and students

• Professional development on topics 
such as Engagement 101,  building 
engagement in one’s dossier, publishing 
engaged scholarship, and broader 
impacts planning

• Emerging Engagement Scholars 
Workshop, virtual learning throughout 
the year for anyone at member 
institutions

• Outreach and Engagement 
Professionals Network

• ESC small grants program

• ESC awards program

• Journal of Higher Education Outreach 
and Engagement and Journal of 
Community Engagement and 
Scholarship

For leaders seeking to institutionalize 
engaged scholarship

• Engagement Academy for University 
Leaders

• ESC leadership roles for both current 
and emerging leaders

• Monthly Engagement Exchange for 
Leaders: discussion of key areas such as 
developing university councils, 
preparing for the Carnegie Engagement 
Classification, strategic planning for 
engagement, community-engaged 
learning supports, and faculty fellows 
programs

Annual conference: For everyone!

• Meet with hundreds of like-minded 
faculty, practitioners, and leaders

• Dozens of presentation opportunities 
for engaged research and creative arts, 
teaching, and service

• Pre-conference workshops for skill-
building for those doing engaged work 
with communities and for leaders 
creating change in their institutions

• Opportunities to host and/or 
collaborate with institutions in your 
region to host the conference and 
highlight local work

Email: info@engagementscholarship.org
Website: engagementscholarship.org

mailto:membership@engagementscholarship.org
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